



THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 North Pace Blvd.
Pensacola, FL 32505

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE:
September 2, 2015

BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
Condiments, Spices & Staples, Bid #160502

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual agreement (with the ability to renew for two (2) more successive one (1) year periods) to provide condiments, spices and staples for school cafeterias as stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse. Eighty (80) items bid, with seventy-three (73) items awarded. Items not awarded are due to lack of bidder response and/or samples either not meeting specifications or submitted. Items will be purchased as needed to meet cafeteria usage requirements. Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.

Effective Dates: October 1, 2015 through September 30, 2016.

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME:	ITEMS AWARDED:	ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE:
Butler Foods of Pensacola, Inc., Cantonment, FL	5	\$ 15,109.50
Butter Buds, Racine, WI	2	33,141.00
J&J Snacks Food, Pennsauken, NJ	2	57,942.50
JTM Provisions, Harrison, OH	3	59,604.40
Kelley Foods of Alabama, Elba, AL	21	178,466.00
Majestic Intl. Spice Corp., Commerce, CA	4	2,058.00
Red Gold, LLC, Elwood, IN	6	53,361.50
Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL	5	12,054.50
US Foods, Montgomery, AL	25	252,432.10

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:

\$664,169.50 Est. / Yr.

FUNDING SOURCE:

Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD Bid

Responses Received: 12

DATE AND TIME POSTED:

September 2, 2015, 2:00 pm Central Time

**THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505
BID TABULATION**

DATE: August 11, 2015

Awarded Items are highlighted

BID NBR: 160502

BID TITLE: Condiments, Spices, and Staples

Where two prices are shown, the bottom price is the bid case/pack size
Top price is unit price needed to determine low cost because of vendor differences in case count

ITEM	Black Olives, Sliced 24 cs 0502170	Banana Pepper Rings 100 gal 0502180	Jalapeno Peppers 90 cs 0502190	Salsa, Canned 150 cs 0502393
ITEM NUMBER	1	2	3	4
Butler Foods of Pensacola			9.6600	6.5100
Cantonment, FL	NO BID	9.85	57.96	39.07
Butter Buds				
Racine, WI	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Cookietree Bakeries				
Salt Lake City, UT	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
J&J Snack Foods				
Pennsauken, NJ	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
JTM Provisions Co.				
Harrison, OH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Kelley Foods of Alabama	5.5760 ap		7.7100 ap	10.4600
Elba, AL	33.4600	NO BID	46.24	41.84
Majestic Intl Spice Corp.				
Commerce, CA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Red Gold, LLC				0.0620 m
Elwood, IN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	25.7300
Sysco Gulf Coast	6.0000	8.7500	4.5916	11.8750 a,u
Geneva, AL	36.00	35.00	27.55	47.50
Tools For Schools				
Emmelt, ID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
US Foods		7.3700 a,u		9.3425
Montgomery, AL	32.9500	29.4800 m	27.8500 a	37.3700
Wowbutter Foods				
Stoffa, ON, Canada	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

ITEM Quantity:	Vanilla, Imitation Extract 30 gl 0505110	Marinara Sauce 150 cs 0505200	Alfredo Sauce Mix 600 cs 0505230	Alfredo Sauce, Frozen 560 cs 0513220
ITEM NUMBER	5	6	7	8
Butler Foods of Pensacola Cantonment, FL	13.25	7.0200 42.11		NO BID
Butter Buds Racine, WI	NO BID	NO BID	0.1400 45.8000	NO BID
Cookietree Bakeries Salt Lake City, UT	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
J&J Snack Foods Pennsauken, NJ	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
JTM Provisions Co. Harrison, OH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	0.2184 57.22 m
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	NO BID	5.1600 30.94	NO BID	NO BID
Majestic Intl Spice Corp. Commerce, CA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Red Gold, LLC Elwood, IN	NO BID	0.0560 24.9800	NO BID	NO BID
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	NO BID	5.9167 35.50	NO BID	NO BID
Tools For Schools Emmelt, ID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
US Foods Montgomery, AL	13.2500	4.88167 29.2900	NO BID	NO BID
Wowbutter Foods Stoffa, ON, Canada	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

ITEM Quantity:	Croutons, Individual 90 cs 0505240	Oil, -DELETE Cottenseed 60 gal 0507011	Mayonnaise, Light 300 cs 0507040	Mayonnaise, Light, Individual 1,800 cs 0507330
ITEM NUMBER	9	10	11	12
Butler Foods of Pensacola Cantonment, FL	NO BID	NO BID	10.8200 43.27	0.0959 19.18
Butter Buds Racine, WI	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Cookietree Bakeries Salt Lake City, UT	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
J&J Snack Foods Pennsauken, NJ	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
JTM Provisions Co. Harrison, OH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	0.0750 18.7700 ap	NO BID	8.3750 33.5000 a,y	0.0610 12.2000 a,y
Majestic Intl Spice Corp. Commerce, CA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Red Gold, LLC Elwood, IN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	0.0840 21.00	NO BID	NO BID	0.0643 12.85
Tools For Schools Emmelt, ID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
US Foods Montgomery, AL	0.0690 17.2500 a,u	NO BID	31.1800	0.05425 10.8500
Wowbutter Foods Stoffa, ON, Canada	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

ITEM Quantity:	Mustard, Prepared 50 cs 0507060	Mustard, Individual 1,200 cs 0507070	Barbeque Sauce 200 cs 0507080	Ketchup, Tomato 200 cs 0507090
ITEM NUMBER	13	14	15	16
Butler Foods of Pensacola Cantonment, FL	5.1200 20.47	0.0164 3.27	5.1475 20.59	4.8200 28.91
Butter Buds Racine, WI	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Cookietree Bakeries Salt Lake City, UT	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
J&J Snack Foods Pennsauken, NJ	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
JTM Provisions Co. Harrison, OH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	2.8670 11.4700	0.0216 4.3200	a,y 8.3800 33.5200	a,y 3.7300 22.4000
Majestic Intl Spice Corp. Commerce, CA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Red Gold, LLC Elwood, IN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	0.0160 18.65 m
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	4.9875 19.95	NO BID	9.5000 38.00	NO BID
Tools For Schools Emmelt, ID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
US Foods Montgomery, AL	17.6000	NO BID	6.9400 27.7600	19.3000
Wowbutter Foods Stoffa, ON, Canada	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

ITEM Quantity:	Ketchup, Tomato Individual 900 cs 0507102	Vinegar, White 200 gl 0507110	Worcestershire Sauce 60 gl 0507120	Ranch Style, Dry Salad Dres. Mix 200 cs 0507150
ITEM NUMBER	17	18	19	20
Butler Foods of Pensacola Cantonment, FL	0.0248 24.84		9.35	1.9528 35.15
Butter Buds Racine, WI	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Cookietree Bakeries Salt Lake City, UT	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
J&J Snack Foods Pennsauken, NJ	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
JTM Provisions Co. Harrison, OH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	0.0180 18.4700	1.8370 7.3500	4.4900 17.9500	0.9418 35.7900 a,y
Majestic Intl Spice Corp. Commerce, CA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Red Gold, LLC Elwood, IN	0.0110 m 11.47	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	0.0193 19.2500	2.4917 14.9500	7.7500 31.0000 m	NO BID
Tools For Schools Emmelt, ID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
US Foods Montgomery, AL	0.01728 17.2800	2.2500 m 13.5000	4.6625 m 18.6500	1.2472 22.4500
Wowbutter Foods Stoffa, ON, Canada	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

ITEM Quantity:	Ranch Dressing, Low Fat, Ind. 200 cs 0507230	Ranch Dressing Low Fat 400 cs. New Item	Italian Dressing, Dry Salad 100 cs. 0507160	Dressing, Italian, Low Fat, Ind. 150 cs. 0507190
ITEM NUMBER	21	22	23	24
Butler Foods of Pensacola Cantonment, FL	NO BID	NO BID	3.0356 ap 54.64 u	NO BID
Butter Buds Racine, WI	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Cookiefree Bakeries Salt Lake City, UT	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
J&J Snack Foods Pennsauken, NJ	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
JTM Provisions Co. Harrison, OH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	NO BID	0.1300 a,y 13.0000	2.5680 ap 46.2300	0.0430 a,y 8.6000
Majestic Intl Spice Corp. Commerce, CA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Red Gold, LLC Elwood, IN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	0.0748 14.95	0.1375 13.75	NO BID	0.0775 15.50
Tools For Schools Emmelt, ID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
US Foods Montgomery, AL	0.0645 12.9000	0.1010 10.1000	2.2556 ap 40.6000	0.1759 ap 17.5900 u
Wowbutter Foods Stoffa, ON, Canada	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

ITEM Quantity:	Dressing, Italian, Low Fat, Ind. 300 cs New Item	Honey Mustard, Ind., Pouch 1,200 cs 0507210	Honey Mustard, Ind., Cup 2,000 cs New Item	French Dressing Ind., Pouch 500 cs 0507240
ITEM NUMBER	25	26	27	28
Butler Foods of Pensacola Cantonment, FL	NO BID	0.1004 20.07	NO BID	0.0333 6.67
Butter Buds Racine, WI	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Cookiefree Bakeries Salt Lake City, UT	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
J&J Snack Foods Pennsauken, NJ	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
JTM Provisions Co. Harrison, OH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	NO BID	NO BID	0.1415 a,y 14.15	0.0491 a,y 9.82
Majestic Intl Spice Corp. Commerce, CA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Red Gold, LLC Elwood, IN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	0.1455 14.55	0.0718 14.35	0.1480 14.75	0.0473 9.45
Tools For Schools Emmelt, ID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
US Foods Montgomery, AL	0.1079 10.7900	0.06075 12.1500	0.1086 10.8600	0.0363 7.2500
Wowbutter Foods Stoffa, ON, Canada	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

ITEM Quantity:	Thousand Island Dressing, Ind. 500 cs 0507260	Thousand Island Dressing, Cup 500 cs 0507260	BBQ Sauce, Ind., Pouch 1,000 cs 0507320	BBQ Sauce Ind., Cup 2,000 cs 0507320
ITEM NUMBER	29	30	31	32
Butler Foods of Pensacola Cantonment, FL	0.0333 6.67			
Butter Buds Racine, WI	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Cookietree Bakeries Salt Lake City, UT	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
J&J Snack Foods Pennsauken, NJ	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
JTM Provisions Co. Harrison, OH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	0.0570 11.4000	a,y NO BID	0.0432 8.65	N,y NO BID
Majestic Intl Spice Corp. Commerce, CA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Red Gold, LLC Elwood, IN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	0.0478 9.55	0.1535 15.35	0.0413 8.25	N,u 0.1185 11.85
Tools For Schools Emmelt, ID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
US Foods Montgomery, AL	0.04025 8.0500	0.1076 10.7600	0.0453 9.0500	0.0815 8.1500
Wowbutter Foods Stoffa, ON, Canada	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

ITEM Quantity:	Salsa, Dipping Cup, Low Sod. 900 cs 0507350	Spaghetti Sauce 300 cs 0508050	Cheese Sauce, Jalapeno, Bulk 280 cs 0517620	Sweet and Spicy Seasoning, SF 100 cs New Item-DELETE
ITEM NUMBER	33	34	35	36
Butler Foods of Pensacola Cantonment, FL		7.2150 43.29		
Butter Buds Racine, WI	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Cookietree Bakeries Salt Lake City, UT	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
J&J Snack Foods Pennsauken, NJ	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
JTM Provisions Co. Harrison, OH	NO BID	NO BID	0.2355 61.94	m NO BID
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	NO BID	5.0200 30.11	NO BID	NO BID
Majestic Intl Spice Corp. Commerce, CA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3.5000 21.0000
Red Gold, LLC Elwood, IN	.1577/152 26.42/51.09	m 0.0440 23.0800		
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	0.3810 32.00	4.9917 29.95	9.6667 58.00	a,u NO BID
Tools For Schools Emmelt, ID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
US Foods Montgomery, AL	NO BID	25.3500	NO BID	NO BID
Wowbutter Foods Stoffa, ON, Canada	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

ITEM	Onions		Meat Base, Beef Low Sodium		Meat Base, Chick Low Sodium		Basil Ground	
Quantity:	100	cs	150	cn	150	cn	84	cn
	0502160		0504010		0504020		0510071	
ITEM NUMBER	37		38		39		40	
Butler Foods of Pensacola Cantonment, FL	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Butter Buds Racine, WI	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Cookiecree Bakeries Salt Lake City, UT	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
J&J Snack Foods Pennsauken, NJ	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
JTM Provisions Co. Harrison, OH	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	NO BID		6.5250 39.1500		6.4580 38.7500		0.3400 24.42	
Majestic Intl Spice Corp. Commerce, CA	2.0200 30.3000		NO BID		NO BID		0.1660 4.0000	a,u
Red Gold, LLC Elwood, IN	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tools For Schools Emmelt, ID	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
US Foods Montgomery, AL	NO BID		NO BID		7.0500 42.30		0.8440 18.57	
Wowbutter Foods Stoffa, ON, Canada	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	

ITEM	Chili Powder, Dark		Cinnamon, Ground		Cumin, Ground		Garlic, Granulated	
Quantity:	48	cn	48	cn	48	cn	200	cn
	0510220		0510250		0510310		0510340	
ITEM NUMBER	41		42		43		44	
Butler Foods of Pensacola Cantonment, FL	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Butter Buds Racine, WI	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Cookiecree Bakeries Salt Lake City, UT	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
J&J Snack Foods Pennsauken, NJ	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
JTM Provisions Co. Harrison, OH	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	4.2600 25.55		4.3400 26.01		5.8400 35.0600		6.6100 39.6500	
Majestic Intl Spice Corp. Commerce, CA	7.7500 7.7500		4.5000 4.5000		6.7500 6.7500		7.5000 7.5000	
Red Gold, LLC Elwood, IN	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tools For Schools Emmelt, ID	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
US Foods Montgomery, AL	8.99		7.6500 45.90		8.8100 52.86	m	11.4900 68.9400	m ap,u
Wowbutter Foods Stoffa, ON, Canada	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	

ITEM Quantity:	Gravy Base 48 qt 0510430	Oregano, Ground 48 cn 0510602	Paprika, Ground 50 cs 0510630	Parsley, Flakes 96 cn 0510660
ITEM NUMBER	45	46	47	48
Butler Foods of Pensacola Cantonment, FL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Butter Buds Racine, WI	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Cookiefree Bakeries Salt Lake City, UT	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
J&J Snack Foods Pennsauken, NJ	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
JTM Provisions Co. Harrison, OH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	7.3330 88.0000	6.8700 41.2300	4.7150 28.2900	7.9500 23.8600
Majestic Intl Spice Corp. Commerce, CA	NO BID	3.5000 3.5000	4.0000 4.0000	6.5000 6.5000 a,u
Red Gold, LLC Elwood, IN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Tools For Schools Emmelt, ID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
US Foods Montgomery, AL	6.9500 m	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Wowbutter Foods Stoffa, ON, Canada	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

ITEM Quantity:	Pepper, Black Ground 192 cn 0510690	Pepper, Black, Gd., Individ. 30 cs 0510721	Salt-DELETE 48 cs 0510780	Hot Sauce, Individual 400 cs 0507200
ITEM NUMBER	49	50	51	52
Butler Foods of Pensacola Cantonment, FL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Butter Buds Racine, WI	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Cookiefree Bakeries Salt Lake City, UT	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
J&J Snack Foods Pennsauken, NJ	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
JTM Provisions Co. Harrison, OH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	9.3050 55.8300	0.0033 10.1200	NO BID	0.0337 6.7400 a,y
Majestic Intl Spice Corp. Commerce, CA	7.7500 7.7500	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Red Gold, LLC Elwood, IN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Tools For Schools Emmelt, ID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
US Foods Montgomery, AL	12.7000 76.2000	0.003163 9.4900	NO BID	0.0250 4.9900 a,u
Wowbutter Foods Stoffa, ON, Canada	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

ITEM	Lemon Juice 150 gal 0503020	Baking-DELETE Soda 50 cs 0505020	Flour,-DELETE All Purpose 50 bg 0505180	Fettuccine Noodle, Whole Grain 600 cs 0505210
Quantity:				
ITEM NUMBER	53	54	55	56
Butler Foods of Pensacola Cantonment, FL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Butter Buds Racine, WI	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Cookietree Bakeries Salt Lake City, UT	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
J&J Snack Foods Pennsauken, NJ	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
JTM Provisions Co. Harrison, OH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	4.6250 18.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Majestic Intl Spice Corp. Commerce, CA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Red Gold, LLC Elwood, IN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	9.2500 m 37.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Tools For Schools Emmelt, ID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
US Foods Montgomery, AL	8.2250 32.90	NO BID	NO BID	24.50
Wowbutter Foods Stoffa, ON, Canada	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

ITEM	Graham Snacks, Whole Grain 2,100 cs 0505250	Oats 50 cs 0506121	Spaghetti, Noodles Th, Whl Grain 600 cs 0508042	Rice, Brown 600 bg 0508090
Quantity:				
ITEM NUMBER	57	58	59	60
Butler Foods of Pensacola Cantonment, FL	0.2135 41.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Butter Buds Racine, WI	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Cookietree Bakeries Salt Lake City, UT	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
J&J Snack Foods Pennsauken, NJ	.125/.135/.14 25.00/27.00/28.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
JTM Provisions Co. Harrison, OH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	.1925/.1359 40.44/20.39	NO BID	0.8785 17.57	NO BID
Majestic Intl Spice Corp. Commerce, CA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Red Gold, LLC Elwood, IN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	.1850/.1350 38.85/20.25	3.0834 37.00	0.9225 18.45	0.9200 23.40
Tools For Schools Emmelt, ID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	0.5990 a,y 14.9800 ib
US Foods Montgomery, AL	44.9600	33.7500	17.2000	17.5600
Wowbutter Foods Stoffa, ON, Canada	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

ITEM Quantity:	Rotini, Nood,Whl Gr.,Gar,Tri-Col 100-DELETE cs 0508120	Jelly 200 cs 0511050	Sugar, Confectioners 50 cs 0511121	Sugar, Lt. Brown 100 cs 0511161
ITEM NUMBER	61	62	63	64
Butler Foods of Pensacola Cantonment, FL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Butter Buds Racine, WI	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Cookietree Bakeries Salt Lake City, UT	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
J&J Snack Foods Pennsauken, NJ	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
JTM Provisions Co. Harrison, OH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	NO BID	7.7600 46.58	NO BID	NO BID
Majestic Intl Spice Corp. Commerce, CA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Red Gold, LLC Elwood, IN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	NO BID	8.0000 48.00	1.1250 27.00	1.1250 27.0000
Tools For Schools Emmelt, ID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
US Foods Montgomery, AL	NO BID	7.5750 45.4500	NO BID	NO BID
Wowbutter Foods Stoffa, ON, Canada	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

ITEM Quantity:	Sugar, Granulated 150 bg 0511170	Sweetener, Artificial 100 cs 0511182	Cream of Chicken Soup 50 cs 0512040	Cream of Mushrm. Soup 50 cs 0512050
ITEM NUMBER	65	66	67	68
Butler Foods of Pensacola Cantonment, FL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Butter Buds Racine, WI	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Cookietree Bakeries Salt Lake City, UT	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
J&J Snack Foods Pennsauken, NJ	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
JTM Provisions Co. Harrison, OH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Majestic Intl Spice Corp. Commerce, CA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Red Gold, LLC Elwood, IN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	0.6200 31.00	0.0120 23.85	3.8334 46.00	3.8334 46.00
Tools For Schools Emmelt, ID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
US Foods Montgomery, AL	NO BID	0.0097 19.4000	2.7300 32.8000	2.6870 32.2500
Wowbutter Foods Stoffa, ON, Canada	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

ITEM Quantity:	Breadstick, Whl Grain 1,600 cs 0516642	Pretzels, Soft, Whl Grain 150 cs 0517050	Cookie Dough, RF Whl Gr, Frz 1,350 cs	Biscuits, Whl Gr Large 2,400 cs 0517290
ITEM NUMBER	69	70	71	72
Butler Foods of Pensacola Cantonment, FL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	0.2070 44.7200
Butter Buds Racine, WI	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Cookietree Bakeries Salt Lake City, UT	NO BID	NO BID	.15/.15/.13/ .014 m 36.72/36.97/3 2.73/36.39 a,u	NO BID
J&J Snack Foods Pennsauken, NJ	NO BID	0.2295 22.9500	.1764/.1444/ .1389 .1389/.1672/ .1646/.1764	25.40/26.00 NO BID
JTM Provisions Co. Harrison, OH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	0.1582 22.7800	NO BID	0.1091 21.3800	0.1260 27.2200
Majestic Intl Spice Corp. Commerce, CA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Red Gold, LLC Elwood, IN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	0.1566 22.55	0.2334 35.00	NO BID	0.1531 27.85
Tools For Schools Emmelt, ID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
US Foods Montgomery, AL	0.1525 21.9600	NO BID	NO BID	0.1299 28.0500
Wowbutter Foods Stoffa, ON, Canada	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

ITEM Quantity:	Biscuits, Whl Grain, Small 2,400 cs 0517290	Sunflower Seed Nut Butter 450 cs 0512172	Pan/Food Spray, Butter 300 cs 0502100	Hummus 150 cs 0517390
ITEM NUMBER	73	74	75	76
Butler Foods of Pensacola Cantonment, FL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Butter Buds Racine, WI	NO BID	NO BID	3.1450 18.8700	NO BID
Cookietree Bakeries Salt Lake City, UT	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
J&J Snack Foods Pennsauken, NJ	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
JTM Provisions Co. Harrison, OH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	0.2838 m 68.1200
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	0.0989 20.7700	ap N,y	3.3900 20.3200	NO BID
Majestic Intl Spice Corp. Commerce, CA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Red Gold, LLC Elwood, IN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	0.0919 30.85	a,u 2.4267	3.9750 23.8500	NO BID
Tools For Schools Emmelt, ID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
US Foods Montgomery, AL	NO BID	72.8000	3.2983 19.7900	NO BID
Wowbutter Foods Stoffa, ON, Canada	NO BID	0.1600 20.0000	m bu	NO BID

ITEM Quantity:	Black Beans, Canned 200 cs 0502070	Muffin, Variety Large, Frz. 1,200 cs 0517230	Stuffing Mix, Whl Grain 200 cs New Item	Edamame, Dry Roasted-DELETE 200 cs New Item
ITEM NUMBER	77	78	79	80
Butler Foods of Pensacola Cantonment, FL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Butter Buds Racine, WI	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Cookietree Bakeries Salt Lake City, UT	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
J&J Snack Foods Pennsauken, NJ	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
JTM Provisions Co. Harrison, OH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	NO BID	NO BID	2.4900 29.8600	NO BID
Majestic Intl Spice Corp. Commerce, CA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Red Gold, LLC Elwood, IN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Tools For Schools Emmelt, ID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
US Foods Montgomery, AL	20.9000	0.4625 22.2000	NO BID	NO BID
Wowbutter Foods Stoffa, ON, Canada	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

N - No prior approved brand

a = Alternate bid

ap= Alternate pack size

m = Vendor bid minimum shipment

p = Pack size not acceptable

u = Unacceptable, no sample sent or sample not approved

y = Sample received and approved

mu=minimum not acceptable

ea= price per each

ib=incomplete bid information

bu=bid unacceptable

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: <http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids>.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes will constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes and School Board Rules. Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department